COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid Tab
BID NO: RFQ 25/06
SUBJECT: Dell Computers
DATE: 5/29/2024
SCHOOL/DEPT: Tech Svs
AWARDED TO: Converge One, Inc.
ConvergeOne, Inc Frontier DHE Computer  Eze Technologies, Aztek Computers,
Technology LLC Systems Inc. LLC
Aha MinsraA aca
Bloomington, MN Phoenix, AZ Centennial, CO Los Angeles, CA Carrollton, TX
#1 OPTIPLEX Micro Form Factor (Standard)
Specifications Met
Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty $ 603.00 | $ 814.74 | § 818.59 | No Bid $ 799.63
Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty $ 637.47 | $ 814.74 | § 861.45 | No Bid No Bid
Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty $ 652.17 | $ 814.74 | § 880.08 | § 935.00 | $ 809.63
Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty $ 666.87 | $ 847.51 | $§ 898.72 | § 1,099.00 | No Bid
#2 Precision 3590- WINDOWS - CLAMSHELL 10-Key
Specifications Met
Option 1 - 1 Year Mail-In Warranty $ 1,470.24 | $ 1,424.69 | $ 1,404.13 [ $ 1,460.00 | $ 1,309.99
Option 2 - 2 Year Mail In Warranty $ 1,309.00 | $ 1,435.68 | $ 1,489.17 | No Bid No Bid
Option 3 - 3 Year Mail In Warranty $ 1,504.84 | $ 1,456.68 | $ 1,52599 | $ 1,578.00 | $ 1,414.99
Option 4 - 4 Year Mail In Warranty $ 1,543.00 | $ 1,466.69 | $ 1,568.71 | § 1,864.00 | No Bid
#3 PRECISION 3490 - WINDOWS - CLAMSHELL — Teachers Devices PK-8
Specifications Met
Option 1 - 1 Year Mail-In Warranty $ 1,150.00 | § 1,370.78 | $ 1,352.12 | § 1,450.00 | $ 1,279.90
Option 2 - 2 Year Mail In Warranty $ 1,199.80 | § 1,381.77 | $ 1,437.17 | No Bid $ 1,384.99
Option 3 - 3 Year Mail In Warranty $ 1,220.60 | $ 1,402.77 | $ 1,473.88 | § 1,568.00 | § 1,494.99
Option 4 - 4 Year Mail In Warranty $ 1,245.87 | § 1,412.78 | $ 1,516.71 | § 1,854.00 | No Bid
#4 PRECISION 5490 (w/ touch) - Teacher Devices 9-12
Specifications Met
Option 1 - 1 Year Mail-In Warranty $ 1,659.00 | $ 2,569.13 | § 1,957.08 | $ 2,750.00 | $ 2,049.92
Option 2 - 2 Year Mail In Warranty $ 1,779.96 | $ 2,580.12 | § 2,095.21 | No Bid $ 2,169.99
Option 3 - 3 Year Mail In Warranty $ 1,838.55 | $ 2,601.12 | § 2,164.77 | § 2,868.00 | § 2,269.99
Option 4 - 4 Year Mail In Warranty $ 1,897.13 | $ 2,611.13 | § 223434 | § 3,154.00 | No Bid
#5 LATITUDE 3140 2 N 1) Windows - Student Devices
Specifications Met
Option 1 - 1 Year Mail-In Warranty $ 549.83 $ 740.78 | $ 720.00 | $ 599.99
Option 2 - 2 Year Mail In Warranty $ 577.09 $ 77245 | $ 743.00 | No Bid
Option 3 - 3 Year Mail In Warranty $ 605.33 $ 804.12 | $ 765.19 | $ 689.75
Option 4 - 4 Year Mail In Warranty $ 644.18 $ 849.97 | § 787.79 | No Bid
Option 5 - 4 Year mail in w ADP $ 720.00 No Bid $ 936.51 | $ 848.39 | No Bid
#6 PRECISION 3680 - eSports
Specifications Met
Headset AWS520H $ 84.99 [ No bid $ 92.69 $ 1,719.99
Monitor AW2523HF $ 299.47 | No bid Unavailable $ 2,019.99
KB & Mouse AW510K & AW610M $ 146.17 | No bid $ 162.19 $ 2,164.99
Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty $ 1,629.00 | $ 141150 $ 1,782.84 included
Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty $ 1,640.00 | $ 141150 $ 1,850.76 included
Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty $ 1,672.33 | $ 141150 $ 1,888.14 included
Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty $ 1,705.63 | $ 1,44427 | $ 1,925.53 No Bid No bid
DELL MONITORS AND ACCESSORIES
1 Dell Monitor 24" P-Series - P2422H (Height, Tilt, Swivel, Pivot) | $ 156.54 | $ 165.15 | $ 159.74 | $ 182.00 | $ 169.99
2 Dell Hub Monitor 24" USB C - RJ45 w/Popup WebCam $ 348.94 | $ 382.06 | $ 373.85 | $ 420.00 | $ 355.40
3 Dell USB-C to HDMI 2.0 / USB-A 3.0 Adapter $ 27.00 | No Bid $ 3630 | $ 39.00 | § 34.99
4 WD19S - No 3.5mm Audio Jack USB-C $ 21099 | § 189.84 | § 181.53 | § 210.00 | § 179.50
5 WD22TB4 Dock Thunderbolt 4 dock. Up to 4k displays $ 252.00 | § 284.76 | $ 27230 | $ 31500 | $ 266.90
6 WDI19DCS 7-series Precision laptops. Up to 6 displays. $ 37425 | $ 341.71 | $ 326.76 | $ 360.00 | § 319.58
7 DA310 - USB Mini Port Replicator $ 6334 | $ 90.71 | § 88.14 | § 110.00 | § 87.65
8 Dell Wireless Keyboard and Mouse Combo KM5221W $ 34.00 | § 4745 | $ 4538 | $ 55.00 | § 46.50
9 Dell Wired Mouse MS116 $ 14.00 | § 1897 | § 18.15 | § 21.00 | § 18.06
10 Dell Wired Multimedia Keyboard English KB522 $ 16.50 | $ 2372 | § 22.68 | § 3200 $ 22.73




11 Dell Active pen for 3140 2n1 $ 45.00 | No Bid $ 2635 |8 89.00 | $ 26.52
12 Dell Active pen for 5490 $ 45.00 | $ 2556 | § 2635 $ 39.00 | § 26.52
13 Dell Charger & Power Adapter for Dell 3140 (2nl) $ 32.81 | No Bid $ 4538 | $ 45.00 | $ 31.99
14 Dell Charger & Power Adapter for Dell 3340 (2n1) $ 75.00 | No Bid $ 4538 | $ 45.00 | $ 31.99
15 Dell Charger & Power Adapter for Dell 3390 (2n1) $ 32.81 | No Bid $ 4538 | $ 50.00 | § 31.99
16 Dell Charger & Power Adapter for Dell 3590 $ 79.00 | No Bid $ 72.60 | No Bid $ 36.99
17 Dell Charger & Power Adapter for Dell 5490 $ 75.00 | No Bid $ 72.60 | $ 50.00 | $ 36.99
18 Dell Charger & Power Adapter for Dell 3490 $ 75.00 | No Bid $ 72.60 | Bo Bid $ 36.99
$10 fee for imaging




